
DOMINION CRAFTSMEN 2023 
PRAYERS FOR 6PM-SHIFT 

SPECIAL PRAYERS FOR DIVINE ENCOUNTER 

INTERNATIONAL CONVOCATION 2023 –  

TAKING POSSESSION OF YOUR INHERITANCE! 

Saturday, June 3rd - Friday, June 9th, 2023 

1. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, thank You for gloriously and

safely bringing us into the month of June - our Covenant Month

Of Mind-Blowing Breakthroughs! Father, according to Your

prophetic word, breakthrough for the entire CTMI and DIC

family and command mind-blowing victories, healings,

deliverances, miracles, and salvations in all our onsite and

online services, outreaches, and convocations this month and

forever! Father, let great multitudes from all nations, come

together to all CTMI ministries and DIC churches to hear Your

word, and to be healed by You this month and forever! 1

Chronicles 14:11; Isaiah 58:8; Psalm 44:4; Luke 5:15

I have set watchmen on your walls, O Jerusalem; They shall never hold their peace day or night. 

You who make mention of the Lord, do not keep silent, 7 And give Him no rest till He establishes 

And till He makes Jerusalem a praise in the earth. Isaiah 62:6-7 

Then the Lord showed me four craftsmen. And I said, “What are these coming to do?” So he said, 

“These are the horns that scattered Judah, so that no one could lift up his head; but [a]the 

craftsmen are coming to terrify them, to cast out the horns of the nations that lifted up their horn 

against the land of Judah to scatter it.” Zechariah 1:20-21 



2. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, thank You for showing Your 
glory and greatness to us in the past Divine Encounter 
International Convocations! Father, thank You for Your great 
goodness, and the irreversible blessings of salvation, healing, 
deliverance, and divine encounters that You bestowed upon us!

Father, thank You in advance for the greater glory and power 
that You will manifest to us in Divine Encounter International 
Convocation 2023 – Taking Possession Of Your Inheritance!

Deuteronomy 5:24; Isaiah 63:7; Numbers 23:20; Haggai 2:9

3. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, thank You for the glorious 
wonders without number that You did in all the previous East 
African Dominion Leadership Summits, and for even greater 
things that You will do in this month’s Dominion Leadership 
Summits in Kenya! Father, let Your great grace and power rest 
upon all Your ministers and let all ministrations be done in the 
demonstration of Your Spirit and power, not with enticing words 

of human wisdom! Father, according to Your word, stretch Your 

hand over every session of the summit, to heal and confirm Your 

word with miracles, signs, and wonders! Job 9:10; Acts 

4:30-31,33; 1 Corinthians 2:4-5

4. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, thank You for the great and 
effective door that You opened for CTMI in East Africa to host 
Dominion Leadership Summits in Kenya again this year! Father, 
according to Your word, let Your presence go before us and give 
us rest on every side – there shall be no adversary or evil 
occurrence in Jesus’ name, amen! Father, according to Your 
divine mandate, through this year’s leadership summit raise up 
faithful kingdom leaders, both in the ministry and marketplace



who shall do according to what is in Your heart and Your mind 

for the nation of Kenya and the entire world! 1 Corinthians 16:9; 

Exodus 33:14; 1 Kings 5:4; 1 Samuel 2:35 

5. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, pour out Your Spirit mightily

upon the entire nation of Tanzania and let a great revival and

spiritual awakening break forth throughout the entire land!

Father, according to Your word, let Your knowledge be diffused

with power through Your Church in Tanzania and let the

knowledge of Your glory cover the entire land as the waters

cover the sea! Father, according to Your word, open a door for

CTMI and DIC to speak and manifest the mystery of Christ with

power in the nation of Tanzania, and cut down every satanic

adversary, in Jesus’ name, amen! Acts 2:1-3; 2 Corinthians 2:14;

Habakkuk 2:14; 1 Corinthians 16:9; Job 22:20

Saturday, June 10th - Friday, June 16th, 2023 

1. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word, in this

Covenant Month Of Mind-Blowing Breakthroughs and forever, let

Your glory rise upon all CTMI ministries, DIC churches, and every

living church on earth! Father, fill all our onsite and online

meetings with Your glory and work unusual miracles of salvation,

healing, and deliverance in all our online and onsite services,

outreaches, and convocations including the Divine Encounter

International Convocation 2023! Father, according to Your word,

let great multitudes of people from all nations and generations

come to all DIC Churches to be joined to the Lord and established



in Your House forever! Isaiah 60:1-3; Exodus 40:34; Acts 19:11; 

Zechariah 2:10-11 

2. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word, sit

enthroned as King forever over all sessions of the Divine Encounter

International Convocation 2023 and strengthen and bless us with

Your peace! Father, according to Your word, appear to every

attendee in Your glory - build us up and establish us in the lifestyle

of righteousness, riches, and relevance forever! Father, as we all

behold Your glory in every session of DEIC 2023, change us into

Your image from glory to glory by the power of Your Spirit, in

Jesus’ name, amen! Psalm 29:10-11; Psalm 102:16; Colossians 2:6-

7; 2 Corinthians 3:18

3. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word, plant

in the hearts of every attendee of the DEIC 2023, a deep longing

and thirst to see Your power and glory during this year’s

convocation and forever! Father, according to Your word, pour out

Your Spirit mightily on the entire CTMI and DIC family such as we

have never seen before, during the DEIC 2023 and forever! Father,

let the outpouring of Your Spirit trigger unprecedented spiritual,

numerical, financial, global, and influential growth of the entire

CTMI and DIC family this year and forever! Psalm 63:1-2; Isaiah

44:3-4; Isaiah 32:15

4. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word, pour

out Your Spirit of love in the hearts of the entire CTMI and DIC

family, and grant us the grace to be of one mind and one spirit as

we prepare for the DEIC 2023! Father, empower all departments

to keep the unity of the Spirit in the bond of peace in the bond of

peace, and let there be no division or contention amongst us!



Father, command Your blessing upon the DEIC 2023 and let all our 

plans and preparations for the convocation be successfully 

executed!  Romans 5:5; Philippians 1:27; Ephesians 4:2-3; Psalm 

133:1-3 

5. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, pour out Your Spirit mightily

upon the entire nation of Ethiopia and let peace, justice,

righteousness, and prosperity reign in the land! Father, let a

mighty revival breakforth in all the churches in Ethiopia and let the

knowledge of Your glory fill the entire land as the waters cover the

sea! Father, according to Your word, open a door for CTMI and DIC

to speak and manifest the mystery of Christ with power in the

nation of Ethiopia, and shatter every satanic adversary! Isaiah

32:15-17; Habakkuk 2:14; Colossians 4:3-4; 1 Corinthians 16:9

Saturday, June 17th - Friday, June 23rd, 2023 

1. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word, let

Your glory rise mightily upon the Divine Encounter International

Convocation 2023 and activate a massive spiritual revival in all

CTMI ministries, DIC churches, and every living church on earth!

Father, according to Your word, establish and exalt Your House

and cause all peoples from all nations to flow to all Your

Churches this month and forever! Father, according to Your

word, make all CTMI ministries, DIC churches and every living

church on earth, to be mountains of holiness where great

multitudes are taught in the way of the Lord and transformed

by the power of His Spirit! Isaiah 60:1-3: Micah 4:1-2; Obadiah

1:17; 2 Corinthians 3:18



2. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word, let

Your glory appear to all people during every session of the

Divine Encounter International Convocation 2023! Father, let

Your eyes be open and ears attentive to every prayer made by

Your people in all DIC churches during DEIC 2023 and forever!

Father, let everyone who comes to this year’s convocation have

a life-changing encounter with You from which we will never

recover! Leviticus 9:23; Psalm 102:16-17; 2 Chronicles 7:15; 2

Corinthians 3:18

3. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word,

prepare the hearts of all Your people to seek You and have life-

changing encounters at this year’s Divine Encounter

International Convocation! Father, according to Your word,

break up the fallow ground of our hearts, and let every

stumbling-block of unbelief, sin, and pride be taking out of the

way! Father, revive everyone who attends DEIC 2023 and raise

us all to new levels of glory by the power of Your Spirit, in Jesus’

name, amen! Psalm 10:17; Hosea 10:12; Isaiah 57:14-15; 2

Corinthians 3:18

4. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, thank You for Your mercies,

great goodness, and lovingkindness which You have bestowed

upon every man in the CTMI and DIC family! Father, according

to Your word, give every man in CTMI and DIC a wise and

understanding heart to lead their families in the way of the

Lord! Father, according to Your word, bless every man in CTMI

and DIC in all things, and let them prosper and be in health even

as their soul prospers, in Jesus’ name, amen! Isaiah 63:7;

Genesis 18:17-19; Genesis 24:1; 3 John 2



5. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, pour out Your Spirit mightily

upon the entire nation of India and let peace, justice,

righteousness, and prosperity reign in the land! Father,

terminate every persecution against Christians in India, and let

all the churches throughout the land have rest, become edified

and greatly multiplied. Father, according to Your word, open a

door for CTMI and DIC to speak and manifest the mystery of

Christ with power in the nation of India, and shatter every

satanic adversary! Isaiah 32:15-17; Acts 9:31; Colossians 4:3-4; 1

Corinthians 16:9

Saturday, 24th - Friday, June 30th, 2023 

1. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word, let

Your glory cover all CTMI ministries, DIC churches and every living

church on earth! Father, let there be an unprecedented

manifestation and demonstration of Your Holy Spirit in all our

onsite and online services, meetings, convocations, and

outreaches, through mighty signs and miracles of salvation,

healing, and deliverance! Father, according to Your word, let the

manifestation of Your glory trigger unprecedented all-round

growth of all CTMI ministries, DIC churches, and every living church

on earth, this year and forever! Exodus 40:34; 1 Corinthians 2:4-5;

Romans 15:19; Isaiah 60:19,22

2. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word show

Your glory and greatness in all sessions of Divine Encounter

International Convocation 2023 and forever! Father, according to

Your word, cause Your glorious voice to be heard and beat down

and reduce to nothing every satanic adversary contending against



our inheritance! Father, according to Your prophetic word, upon 

the mountain of DEIC 2023 there shall be deliverance, holiness and 

we shall possess all our possessions! Deuteronomy 5:24; Isaiah 

30:30-31; Isaiah 41:11-13; Obadiah 1:17 

3. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word, upon

the mountain of DEIC 2023 prepare for all peoples, a choice feast

of every good thing! Father, on the mountain of DEIC 2023,

swallow up all forms of death, and take away rebuke and reproach

from our lives forever! Father, according to Your word, open Your

hand and satisfy the desires written on the expectation card of

every single person who attends DEIC 2023, in Jesus’ name, amen!

Isaiah 25:6-8; Luke 1:25; Psalm 145:15-16

4. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, according to Your word,

perfect everything that concerns the Divine Encounter

International Convocation 2023! Father, according to Your word,

go before us and make every crooked place straight and break in

pieces every satanic gate of hindrance! Father, according to Your

word, in DEIC 2023 and forever, do exceedingly abundantly above

all that we ask or think! Psalm 138:8; Isaiah 45:2; Matthew 16:18;

Ephesians 3:20

5. Father, in the name of Jesus Christ, pour out Your Spirit mightily

upon the entire nation of Greece and let a great revival and

spiritual awakening break forth throughout the entire land! Father,

according to Your word, let Your knowledge be diffused with

power through Your Church in Greece and let the knowledge of

Your glory cover the entire land as the waters cover the sea!

Father, according to Your word, open a door for CTMI and DIC to

speak and manifest the mystery of Christ with power in the nation



of Greece, and cut down every satanic adversary, in Jesus’ name, 

amen! Acts 2:1-3; 2 Corinthians 2:14; Habakkuk 2:14; 1 Corinthians 

16:9; Job 22:20  




